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EXHIBIT 5 

New text is underlined; 
Deleted text is in [brackets] 
 
 

MIAMI INTERNATIONAL SECURITIES EXCHANGE, LLC Rules 
 

***** 
 

Rule 700. Exercise of Option Contracts 

(a) - (b)   

(c) Exercise cut-off time. Option holders have until 5:30 p.m. Eastern Time on the business day 
immediately prior to the expiration date or, in the case of Short Term Option Series and 
Quarterly Options Series, on the expiration date, to make a final decision to exercise or not 
exercise an expiring option. Members may not accept exercise instructions for customer or non-
customer accounts after 5:30 p.m. Eastern Time.  Respecting options that expire after February 1, 
2015, option holders have until 5:30 p.m. Eastern Time on the expiration date to make a final 
decision to exercise or not exercise an expiring option.  Members may set earlier cutoff times for 
customers submitting exercise notices.  Clearing Members are permitted to submit exercise 
instructions after the cutoff time only in case of errors or other unusual situations, and may be 
subject to fines or disciplinary actions pursuant to Rule 1014. 

(d)  No Change.   

(i)  No Change.  

(ii) Deadline for CEA Submission for Customer Accounts. Members have until 7:30 p.m. 
Eastern Time on the business day immediately prior to the expiration date or, in the case of Short 
Term Option Series and Quarterly Options Series, on the expiration date, to submit a Contrary 
Exercise Advice to the Exchange.   

(iii) Deadline for CEA Submission for Non-Customer Accounts. Members have until 
7:30 p.m. Eastern Time on the business day immediately prior to the expiration date or, in the 
case of Short Term Option Series and Quarterly Options Series, on the expiration date, to submit 
a Contrary Exercise Advice to the Exchange if such Member employs an electronic submission 
procedure with time stamp for the submission of exercise instructions by option holders. 
Members are required to manually submit a Contrary Exercise Advice by 5:30 p.m. for non-
customer accounts if such Members do not employ an electronic submission procedure with time 
stamp for the submission of exercise instructions by option holders.   
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(e) – (g) No change. 

(h) In the event the Exchange provides advance notice on or before 5:30 p.m. Eastern Time on 
the business day immediately prior to the last business day before the expiration date indicating 
that a modified time for the close of trading in equity options on such last business day before 
expiration will occur, then the deadline to make a final decision to exercise or not exercise an 
expiring option shall be 1 hour 30 minutes following the time announced for the close of trading 
on that day instead of the 5:30 p.m. Eastern Time deadline found in Rule 700(c). However, 
Members have until 7:30 p.m. Eastern Time to deliver a Contrary Exercise Advice or Advice 
Cancel to the Exchange for customer accounts and non-customer accounts where such Member 
employs an electronic submission procedure with time stamp for the submission of exercise 
instructions. For non-customer accounts, Members that do not employ an electronic procedure 
with time stamp for the submission of exercise instructions are required to deliver a Contrary 
Exercise Advice or Advice Cancel within 1 hour and 30 minutes following the time announced 
for the close of trading on that day instead of the 5:30 p.m. Eastern Time deadline found in Rule 
700(d). 

(i) – (k) No change. 

 

***** 


